
$5,200 - 15 Longfellow Street, Hartsdale
MLS® #855447 

$5,200
3 Bedroom, 3.00 Bathroom, 1,664 sqft
Residential Lease on 0.16 Acres

N/A, Hartsdale, NY

Super clean home in the beloved Poets
Corner, conveniently located near the train,
shops, parks, and bus. This well-built stucco
home offers a private, level lot with a patio,
deck, one-car garage, and extended driveway.
Inside, a bright, spacious sitting room with
large windows welcomes you, complemented
by hardwood floors throughout. Enjoy the cozy
living room with a fireplace, a separate dining
room, and a newer eat-in kitchen featuring a
pantry and access to the deck. The main level
also includes a spacious bedroom and hall
bath. Upstairs are two more bedrooms and a
half bath. Another full bath is in the lower level.

The semi-finished walk-out lower level
includes wet bar, rec room, full bath, storage
and utilities. Outstanding patio wood-fired grill/
fireplace and pristine landscaping. Additional
Information:  1 Car Attached,LeaseTerm: 12 +
Months

Built in 1956

Essential Information

MLS® # 855447

Price $5,200

Sold Price $5,200

Date Sold May 2nd, 2025

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 3.00

Full Baths 2



Half Baths 1

Square Footage 1,664

Acres 0.16

Year Built 1956

Type Residential Lease

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Style Tudor

Status Closed

Community Information

Address 15 Longfellow Street

Subdivision N/A

City Hartsdale

County Westchester County

State NY

Zip Code 10530

Amenities

Utilities Trash Collection Public

Parking Spaces 1

Parking Attached

# of Garages 1

Interior

Interior Hardwood

Interior Features Master Downstairs, First Floor Bedroom, First Floor Full Bath, Eat-in
Kitchen, Formal Dining

Appliances Gas Water Heater

Heating Baseboard

Cooling Central Air

Has Basement Yes

Basement Walk-Out Access, Partially Finished

Fireplace Yes

# of Fireplaces 1

Exterior

Exterior Clapboard

School Information



District Greenburgh Central

Elementary Highview School

Middle WOODLANDS MIDDLE/HIGH SCHOOL
 
 (grades 7-12)

High Woodlands Middle/High School

Additional Information

Date Listed April 30th, 2025

Days on Market 2

Levels Three Or More

Pets No

Listing Details
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